
        Name _____________#___ 

Science Project Rubric   

Conclusion  

 

 Outstanding Work  Acceptable Work  Needs Some Work  Needs Lots of Work  Value 

Conclusion Detailed discussion of: 
results, how or why the 
hypothesis was supported 
or rejected, and how this 
experiment could be 
extended.                (15-14) 

Discussion of: results, how 
or why the hypothesis was 
supported or rejected, 
and how this experiment 
could be extended.                                                          
(13-11) 

Some discussion of: 
results, how or why the 
hypothesis was supported 
or rejected, and how this 
experiment could be 
extended.                (10-9) 

Few details of the 
following:  results, how or 
why the hypothesis was 
supported or rejected, and 
how this experiment could 
be extended.                (8-0) 

 
 
 

Punctuation, 
spelling and 
grammar 

Consistently follows rules 
for punctuation, spelling 
and correct use of 
grammar.                       (5) 

Generally follows rules for 
punctuation, spelling and 
correct use of grammar.  
                                        (4)    

Somewhat follows rules of 
punctuation, spelling and 
correct use of grammar.     
                                        (3)   

Does not follow rules for 
punctuation, spelling and 
correct use of grammar.    
                                            (2)                         

 

 
 
Teacher 
comments 

    
 
 
 

                         Total: 

 
 


